
 

Suncrest Psychological Services, LLC is recruiting in Lafayette, Indiana for Licensed 
Psychologists with a Health Service Provider designation eligible Post-Doctoral 
Psychologist seeking placement and supervision to complete licensure. **This position 
is an independent contractor position** 

We offer an established client base in addition to flexible scheduling based on your 
availability and preference from 1-5 days per week at a set rate. This is a specialized 
position working with first responders. Experience with this population is preferred, but 
ride-alongs and additional training experiences can also be arranged. Trauma 
experience, particularly with evidence-based treatments such as CPT and EMDR are 
helpful.  

Days would consist of primarily individual therapy within a specific population of first 
responder organizations (police, fire, EMS, dispatch, and corrections) seen on contract 
and/or insurance. There would be additional option to see couples or children of first 
responders, though this isn’t required. Pre-employment evaluations are also possible, 
based on experience and interest. Responding to Critical incidents in a timely manner 
and supporting departments through these events are also possible. In addition to the 
established client base, we provide a peaceful and safe working environment with office 
space, and assistance with any billing needs. Scheduling can be done individually by 
the applicant or can be done directly by patients through the electronic medical record. 
No need to market, deal with insurance, or hassle with trying to collect payment. 

Dr. Dardeen has been in private practice since 2017 and has contracts with 15 local 
police and fire agencies. This could be a full or part time contract position.  

If you are interested, please send your resume to 
drdardeen@suncrestpsychologicalservices.com or fax to (765) 607-1483. We look 
forward to hearing from you! 

 

Applicants must hold a current license in Indiana as a Psychologist with a Health 
Service Provider designation or be an eligible Post-Doctoral Psychologist seeking 
placement and supervision to complete licensure. Must have a laptop computer and 
computer/word processing skills. 

 
Company Name: 
Suncrest Psychological Services, LLC  
www.suncrestpsychologicalservices.com 
 

Salary: 
$0 - $120,000 Per Year 

http://www.suncrestpsychologicalservices.com/


Job Category: 
Clinical Psychology, Counseling Psychology, Post-Doctoral Residency, Other 

Work Setting: 
Independent Practice 

Position Type: 
Contract 

Experience: 
Less than 2 years 

Education: 
PhD 

 

 

 


